## Bid Tabulation: IFB 011325LP DISTRICTWIDE PRINTERS

		PPM			DLM-No models,no				Tate Computer Systems-		Technology Express-			
	Device Type	minimum	Central Technologies		specs		Novatech-Brother		Lexmark		HP		Thomas Consultants - HP	
	Large Laser Printer- Monochrome-Large Office	52 PPM	Mfr- with Specs & 2 yr warranty on 3D printer	Price	Non-Re	esponsive	Mfr- with Specs & 1 yr warranty	Price	Mfr- with Specs & 1 yr warranty	Price	Mfr- with Specs & 1 yr warranty- HP	Price	Mfr- with Specs & 3 yr warranty	Price
Warranty			Not provided	No Bid			HL-L631DW	\$ 410.56	MS823DN	\$ 1,132.92	M806DN	\$2,949.53	HP M610dn	\$ 723.53
Total							PPM 48		PPM 70		PPM 56		PPM 52	\$ 153.47 \$ 877.00
	Large Laser Color Printer – School or Large Office	33PPM	Not provided	No Bid	Non-Re	esponsive	HL-L8360CD PPM 33	\$ 440.00	CS963E PPM 55	\$ 3,704.34	M751DN PPM 41	\$2,269.94	5700dn PPM 33	\$ 687.83 \$ 132.30 \$ 820.13
Device 3	Medium Laser Color – All in One Printer – Classroom or Office	N/A	Not provided	No Bid	Non-Re	esponsive	MFC-L8395C	\$ 454.33	CX950SE	\$ 3,367.58	M776DN Non	\$4,089.11	4301fdn	\$ 435.13
Warranty Total							PPM 31		PPM 25		Responsive		No Min PPM	\$ 151.20 \$ 586.33
Device 4	Small Laser – Medium Color Printer – Classroom or Office	21 PPM	Not provided	No Bid	Non-Re	esponsive	HL-L3280CD	\$ 293.33	CS730DE	\$ 872.65	M751DN Non	\$2,269.94	5700dn	\$ 687.83
Warranty Total							PPM 27		PPM 42		Responsive		PPM 21	\$ 132.30 \$ 820.13
	Small Laser Monochrome – Classroom or Office	25 PPM	Not provided	No Bid	Non-Re	esponsive	HL-L2460DW	\$ 156.67	MS431DW	\$ 316.03	806DN Non	\$2,949.53	3001DW	\$ 193.50
Warranty Total							PPM 36		PPM 42		Responsive		PPM 25	\$ 77.34 \$ 270.84
Device 6 Warranty	3D Printer	N/A	Robo E4-2 yr warranty	\$ 1,215.00	Non-Re	esponsive		No Bid		No Bid	3D40FLEX	\$1,249.72	Bambu Lab X1E	\$ 2,834.00
Total														

## Bid Tabulation: IFB 011325LP DISTRICTWIDE PRINTERS

		PPM							
	Device Type	minimum	Unistar-Spa	arco-Lexmark	ung Techn	ologies - Brot	Virtucom - HP		
	Large Laser Printer- Monochrome-Large		Mfr- with Specs & 1 yr warranty except for		Mfr- with Specs & 1 yr		Mfr- with Specs/1 yr		
Device 1	Office	52 PPM		Price	-	Price	warranty	Price	
Warranty			MS826E	\$ 2,309.55	HL-L6311	\$ 550.00	M610DN	\$ 1,135.00	
Total			PPM 70	+ ,		•	PPM 55	+ )	
Device 2	Large Laser Color Printer – School or Large Office	33PPM							
Warranty			CS936E	\$ 4,837.16	HL-L8360	\$ 585.00	M554DN	\$ 858.00	
Total			PPM 55		_		PPM 33		
					_				
Device 3	Medium Laser Color – All in One Printer – Classroom or Office	N/A							
Warranty			CX963XSE	\$ 10,471.39	MFC-L96	\$ 1,250.00	4301FDW	\$ 694.00	
Total			PPM 55	¢,		<b>•</b> • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	PPM 35	+	
Device 4	Small Laser – Medium Color Printer – Classroom or Office	21 PPM							
Warranty			CS331W	\$ 356.83	HL3280C	\$ 425.00	3201DW	\$ 354.00	
Total			PPM 26				PPM 26		
Device 5	Small Laser Monochrome – Classroom or Office	25 PPM							
Warranty			MS431DW	\$ 399.94	HL-L2460	\$ 300.00	M209DW	\$ 199.00	
Total			PPM 42				PPM 29		
Device 6	3D Printer	N/A							
			MakerBot Sketch				Boxlight		
Warranty			Sprint	\$ 2,406.01		No Bid	Robo E4 3D	\$ 1,045.00	
Total									